
 

 
 

 

 
 

 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
  

Notice of Intent to Adopt a Mitigated Negative 
Declaration/Notice of Availability Environmental 

Assessment 
Study Results Available 

Announcement of Public Hearing  

            
 

 Widening Proposed on White Rock Road from 
Sunrise Boulevard to Grant Line Road 

 

 

 

WHAT’S BEING 
PLANNED? 

Caltrans (California Department of Transportation), in cooperation with the City of Rancho 
Cordova (City), is proposing to widen and construct improvements to the existing six-lane 
portion of White Rock Road from Sunrise Boulevard to Luyung Drive, including restriping 
and additional pavement for the addition of a second westbound through lane on the east 
leg of Fitzgerald Road/Sunrise Park Drive intersection with White Rock Road. White Rock 
Road will be reconstructed and widened from two lanes to four lanes from Luyung Drive to 
Grant Line Road. The project alternatives being studied will include the above build 
alternative and a no-build alternative that allows for a comparison of not approving the 
proposed project.  
 
The proposed work will encroach upon on seasonal wetlands. The project is being 
evaluated to determine if there are any practical alternatives to avoid this encroachment 
or, if not, to ensure that all practical measures are taken to minimize harm to the seasonal 
wetlands.  
 
The proposed work involves a site on a list enumerated under Section 65962.5 of the 
Government Code pertaining to hazardous wastes.  
 
This project is not considered a Project of Concern regarding particulate matter (PM10 
and PM2.5) as defined in 40 CFR 93.123(b)(1). A detailed PM10 and PM2.5 hot-spot 
analysis was not completed because Clean Air Act and 40 CFR 93.116 requirements are 
met without an explicit hot-spot analysis. 

  



WHY THIS AD? The City and Caltrans have studied the effects this project may have on the environment. 
Our studies show it will not significantly affect the quality of the environment. The report 
explains why it is called an Initial Study with Proposed Mitigated Negative 
Declaration/Environmental Assessment (IS/EA). This notice is to inform you of the 
preparation of the Proposed Mitigated Negative Declaration and IS/EA and of its 
availability for you to review.  
 
A hearing will be held to give you an opportunity to discuss the release of the 
environmental document. General project information including the public review period, 
public comment process, next steps and other display information will be available.   

WHAT’S 
AVAILABLE? 

You can review the Mitigated Negative Declaration and IS/EA and other project 
information at the Rancho Cordova City Hall (2729 Prospect Park Drive, Rancho Cordova, 
CA 95670) on weekdays from 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. Copies may also be reviewed at 
various locations including the Rancho Cordova Library (9845 Folsom Boulevard, 
Sacramento, CA 95827), Gold River Community Association (11715 Gold Country 
Boulevard, Rancho Cordova, CA 95670), Sacramento County Administration Building 
(700 H Street, Sacramento, CA 95814), and Caltrans (703 B St, Marysville, CA 95901), as 
well as for download from the City’s website: 
http://www.cityofranchocordova.org/Index.aspx?page=184 

WHERE YOU 
COME IN 
 

Do you have any comments about processing the project with a Mitigated Negative 
Declaration and IS/EA? Do you disagree with the findings of our study as set forth in the 
Proposed Mitigated Negative Declaration? Would you care to make any other comments 
on the project? 
 
The public review/comment period will end on December 1, 2015. If you have comments 
or concerns on the proposed Mitigated Negative Declaration and IS/EA, you are 
encouraged to submit your comments in writing no later than December 1, 2015 5:00pm 
to the Caltrans District 3 Office, 703 B St, Marysville, CA 95901 (Attn: Kelly McNally) or by 
email to kelly.mcnally@dot.ca.gov. You will also have an opportunity to provide comments 
during the public hearing.  

WHEN & 
WHERE? 

Date:    Monday, November 30, 2015 
Time:   6-7pm 
Place:  Rancho Cordova City Hall 

             2729 Prospect Park Drive, Rancho Cordova, CA 95670 

CONTACT For more information about this study or any transportation matter, call Caltrans, Kelly 
McNally at (530) 741-4134 or the City, Mark Thomas, Senior Engineer at (916) 851-8876.  

SPECIAL 
ACCOMODATI
ONS 

Individuals who require special accommodations (American Sign Language interpreter, 
accessible seating, documentation in alternate formats, etc.) please contact Mark 
Thomas, Senior Engineer at (916) 851-8876 or mthomas@cityofranchocordova.org at 
least 14 days prior to the scheduled meeting date. TDD users may contact the California 
Relay Service TTY line at either 711 or (800)735-2922. 

 

 

http://www.cityofranchocordova.org/Index.aspx?page=184

